
































Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Emma Blain

Date of election or co-option 2019-06-06

Appropriate Period 02/03/2023 - 29/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Emma Blain

Dated: 29/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

Na Na

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Editor

Church of Ireland Gazette
Wallace Ave
Lisburn
BT27 4AA



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

N/A N/A

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A n/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Shay Brennan

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-25

Appropriate Period 01/02/2023 - 31/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Shay Brennan

Dated: 31/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

NA NA

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Deputy Treasurer
14 Fitzwilliam Quay
Ringsend
Dublin 4



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

NA NA

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

NA



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

NA NA

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

NA NA



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

NA NA



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

NA NA NA

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

NA NA

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

NA



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Michael Clark

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-24

Appropriate Period 01/02/2023 - 31/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 31/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Full-time Secondary School Teacher

Part-time Secondary School Teacher

Part-time Lecturer

Public Representative

Part-time Examiner

Gonzaga College SJ, D06 KF95

Mount Anville Secondary School, D14 
A8P3

American College Dublin, D02 NH98

Dún Laoghaire-Rathdown County Council, 
A96 K6C9

State Examinations Commission, N37 TP65



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

N/A N/A

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.















Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Liam Dockery

Date of election or co-option 2022-12-12

Appropriate Period 01/03/2023 - 28/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Liam Dockery

Dated: 28/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Barrister
The Law Library
Four Courts
Dublin



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

89 Belfield Park,
Stillorgan,
Dublin

Rental

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Eva Elizabeth Dowling

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-26

Appropriate Period 01/02/2023 - 31/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 31/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Media and Policy Advisor Leinster House, Dublin 2



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

Family Home

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Daniel Dunne

Date of election or co-option 2018-10-08

Appropriate Period 24/02/2023 - 23/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Daniel Dunne

Dated: 23/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

n/a n/a

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

n/a n/a



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

n/a n/a

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

n/a



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

n/a n/a

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

n/a n/a



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

n/a n/a



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

n/a n/a n/a

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

n/a n/a

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

n/a



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Schedule 

Part 1 

Form A – Local Authority Members 

Dún Laoghaire County Council 

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration 

Name 

Date of election or co-option 

Appropriate period ◊ 

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required

by section 171 of the Local Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at

paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form.  None of the grounds for disqualification

referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under

section 20 of the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure)

Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and

further declare that I understand its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for

Councillors in the exercise of my functions.  (The Code of Conduct for

Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local

Government Act 2001).

Signed:  ____________________________ Dated:_______________________ 

◊ Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests.
For a first declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the
form is signed by you.  In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Martha Fanning

23/2/2024

6.7.2020

2023



Form A – Local Authority Members 
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Part 2 

Declarable Interests 

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 

of the Local Government Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such 

interests held by you (or your nominee as may be required) during the appropriate 

period.  The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be 

specified.  Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.   

 

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land 
Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, 
whether on your own behalf or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or 
developing land during the appropriate period.   
 

Description of profession, 
occupation etc. relating to land 

Business Address 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.  
Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other 
occupation held by you during the appropriate period.   
 

Description of profession, 
occupation, etc. 

Business Address 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

Market Researcher 23 Convent Road, Blackrock, 
Co. Dublin A94 T6E5

Lecturer in Market Research Michael Smurfit 
Graduate Business School, 
Blackrock, Co Dublin

N/A



Form A – Local Authority Members 
Page 1 of 8 

3. Land (ownership, interest) 

Any estate or interest you have in landi in the State (including the case where you 
or your nominee, is a member of a companyii or other body which has an estate or 
interest in land) during the appropriate period and without prejudice to the 
foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include    

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of 
land, whether or not a deposit or part payment has been made under the 
contract; and 

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or 
not any consideration has been paid for it, or land in respect of which such 
an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been conveyed 
to you, 

 

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relatesiii. 

 

Property Address Purpose for which used 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc. 

Any business of dealing in or developing landiv carried on during the appropriate 
period by a company or other body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a 
member, if not declared elsewhere in this form. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

N/A

23 Convent Road,
Blackrock, 
Co. Dublin 
A94 T6E5

Family home
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Form A – Local Authority Members 
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5. Shares etc.  
Any holdingv by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like 
investments in, a particular company or other enterprise or undertaking (which 
does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if the 
aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the 
appropriate period. 
 

Name and address of Company 
where shares etc. are held 

Nature of Business of Company etc. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

6. Directorships 
Any directorship or shadow directorshipvi of any company held by you during the 
appropriate period other than one held by virtue of membership of or employment 
by a local authority. 
 

Business Address of Company Nature of Business 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

N/A

N/A



Form A – Local Authority Members 
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7. Gifts, Property and Services 

Gifts 

 (1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate 
period, but excluding 

  
  (a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or 

of your child or of a child of your spouse [spouse includes a person with 
whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;  

  
  (b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the 

appropriate period, as respects which the value, or the aggregate value, 
of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87 at 
any time during the appropriate period;  

  
(b) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 
Expenditure) Act 1999. 

 
Property and Servicesvii 
(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or 

more than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, for 
a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the 
commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or 
prices, by more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded 
€634.87; or 

 (b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more 
than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, free of 
charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the 
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in 
the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for both (a) and (b) excluding 
(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative 

or friend of yours, or of your spouse, where such supply or loan 
was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,  

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 
statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 
Expenditure) Act 1999. 

 

Description of 
Gift, Property 
and/or Service 

Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier and/or 
Lender 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

N/A



Form A – Local Authority Members 
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8. Local Authority Contracts 
Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or 
indirectly interested for the supply of goods or services to a local authority during 
the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services supplied during the 
period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied 
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of 
their value exceeded €6,348.69.    
 

Name and Address 
of Contractor 

 
Description of Contract  

 
Local Authority 

Concerned 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  

 

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc. 
Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, 
consultant or adviser during the appropriate period.  
 

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company / 
Organisation 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

10. Any Other Additional Interests 
Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

None

N/A N/A

N/A
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NOTES 

 

Appropriate Period 

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of 

declarable interests.  For a first declaration appropriate period means the period of 

12 months leading up to and including the day the annual declaration form is 

signed by you.  In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the 

date of your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.   

 

Non Declaration of Amount(s) 

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified.  

(Section 171(5)) of the Act). 

Land 

i “land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc..  All land interests 

in the State should be declared. 

 

Company 

ii Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the 

Companies Act, 1963 is deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another 

or to be another such company’s holding company, a person who is a member of 

the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other 

company for the purposes of annual declaration.  (Section 166(3) of the Act). 

 

Non-declaration of certain land interests 
iii An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or 

developing land does not have to be declared where such interest is by reason 

only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other body by you or by 

your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the 

lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100
th part of the total nominal value of either the issued 

share capital of the company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of 

more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes of shares in 

which you have an interest.  Section 167(3) of Act refers.  
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Declarable Interest no. 4 
iv See note iii above. 

 

Holding (shares etc.) 
v "holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account 

with a financial institution (see declarable interest no. 5). 

 

 

Shadow Directorship 

 vi "shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow 

director for the purposes of the Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable 

interest no. 6). 

  

  

 Declarable Interest no. 7 
vii Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical 

services, it is only necessary to state that such services were supplied. 

 

 

 

 

 



















Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Feeney Kate

Date of election or co-option 2014-05-24

Appropriate Period 02/03/2023 - 29/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 29/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Chartered Accountant
Chartered Tax Advisor

O'Hara Dolan
Daingean Hall,
N4 Axis Centre,
Battery Rd,
Aughadegnan,
Longford



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

22 Clay Farm Park
Leopardstown
Dublin 18

Family Home

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Lorraine Hall

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-24

Appropriate Period 20/02/2023 - 19/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Lorraine Hall

Dated: 19/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N.A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Public Affairs Consultant, Penta
14 Herbert St, Dublin 2, D02 KD76



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

My home adderss is:

This is my home address and is where I 
live

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

I work as a Public Affairs Consultant 
for Penta. I occasionally  have to 
lobby politicians on behalf of clients, 
all of which is recorded in the 
lobbying register. 

Penta, 14 Herbert St, Dublin 2, D02 
KD76

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

Member of Cualanor Residents Association 
Member of Dún Laoghaire Town Team
Former Special Adviser to Minister for Arts, Heritage and the Gaeltacht (2014- 
2016)
Former Special Adviser to the Minister for Justice (2011 - 2014) 



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name John Kennedy

Date of election or co-option 2016-03-14

Appropriate Period 20/02/2023 - 19/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 19/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

Nil. Nil.

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Software Engineer

County Councillor

SFDC Ireland Ltd. (Salesforce), 
Salesforce Tower, North Dock, Dublin 1

Dun Laoghaire-Rathdown County Council, 
County Hall, Dun Laoghaire, Co.Dublin



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

Nil. Nil.

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

Nil.



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

Nil. Nil.

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

Nil. Nil.



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

Nil. Nil.



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

Nil. Nil. Nil.

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

Nil. Nil.

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

Nil.



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Part 1 

Form A – Local Authority Members 

 

Dún Laoghaire County Council 

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration  

 
Name 
 
 

 
 
Lettie Mc Carthy 

 
Date of election or co-option 
 

 
June, 2019 

 
Appropriate period ◊ 
 
 

 
June 2023 – June 2024 

 
1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required 

by section 171 of the Local Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at 

paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form.  None of the grounds for disqualification 

referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under 

section 20 of the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) 

Act 1999 apply to me, 

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and 

further declare that I understand its meaning, and 

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for 

Councillors in the exercise of my functions.  (The Code of Conduct for 

Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local 

Government Act 2001). 

 

 

 

Signed: Lettie Mc Carthy____________________________  
Dated:___30th January 2024____________________ 

 
◊ Appropriate Period 
Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests.  
For a first declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the 
form is signed by you.  In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of 
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration. 
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Part 2 

Declarable Interests 

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 

of the Local Government Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such 

interests held by you (or your nominee as may be required) during the appropriate 

period.  The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be 

specified.  Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.   

 

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land 
Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, 
whether on your own behalf or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or 
developing land during the appropriate period.   
 

Description of profession, 
occupation etc. relating to land 

Business Address 

 
N/A 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.  
Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other 
occupation held by you during the appropriate period.   
 

Description of profession, 
occupation, etc. 

Business Address 

 
N/A 
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3. Land (ownership, interest) 

Any estate or interest you have in landi in the State (including the case where you 
or your nominee, is a member of a companyii or other body which has an estate or 
interest in land) during the appropriate period and without prejudice to the 
foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include    

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of 
land, whether or not a deposit or part payment has been made under the 
contract; and 

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or 
not any consideration has been paid for it, or land in respect of which such 
an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been conveyed 
to you, 

 

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relatesiii. 

 

Property Address Purpose for which used 

 
 
N/A 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc. 

Any business of dealing in or developing landiv carried on during the appropriate 
period by a company or other body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a 
member, if not declared elsewhere in this form. 

 

 
 
N/A 
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5. Shares etc.  
Any holdingv by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like 
investments in, a particular company or other enterprise or undertaking (which 
does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if the 
aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the 
appropriate period. 
 

Name and address of Company 
where shares etc. are held 

Nature of Business of Company etc. 

 
 
N/A 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

6. Directorships 
Any directorship or shadow directorshipvi of any company held by you during the 
appropriate period other than one held by virtue of membership of or employment 
by a local authority. 
 

Business Address of Company Nature of Business 

 
N/A 
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7. Gifts, Property and Services 

Gifts 

 (1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate 
period, but excluding 

  
  (a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or 

of your child or of a child of your spouse [spouse includes a person with 
whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;  

  
  (b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the 

appropriate period, as respects which the value, or the aggregate value, 
of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87 at 
any time during the appropriate period;  

  
(b) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 
Expenditure) Act 1999. 

 
Property and Servicesvii 
(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or 

more than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, for 
a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the 
commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or 
prices, by more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded 
€634.87; or 

 (b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more 
than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, free of 
charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the 
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in 
the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for both (a) and (b) excluding 
(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative 

or friend of yours, or of your spouse, where such supply or loan 
was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,  

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 
statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 
Expenditure) Act 1999. 

 

Description of 
Gift, Property 
and/or Service 

Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier and/or 
Lender 

 
N/A 
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8. Local Authority Contracts 
Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or 
indirectly interested for the supply of goods or services to a local authority during 
the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services supplied during the 
period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied 
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of 
their value exceeded €6,348.69.    
 

Name and Address 
of Contractor 

 
Description of Contract  

 
Local Authority 

Concerned 

 
 
N/A 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  

 

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc. 
Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, 
consultant or adviser during the appropriate period.  
 

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company / 
Organisation 

 
N/A 
 
 
 
 

 

 

10. Any Other Additional Interests 
Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.  
 

 
None 
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NOTES 

 

Appropriate Period 

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of 

declarable interests.  For a first declaration appropriate period means the period of 

12 months leading up to and including the day the annual declaration form is 

signed by you.  In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the 

date of your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.   

 

Non Declaration of Amount(s) 

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified.  

(Section 171(5)) of the Act). 

Land 

i “land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc..  All land interests 

in the State should be declared. 

 

Company 

ii Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the 

Companies Act, 1963 is deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another 

or to be another such company’s holding company, a person who is a member of 

the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other 

company for the purposes of annual declaration.  (Section 166(3) of the Act). 

 

Non-declaration of certain land interests 

iii An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or 

developing land does not have to be declared where such interest is by reason 

only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other body by you or by 

your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the 

lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100
th part of the total nominal value of either the issued 

share capital of the company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of 

more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes of shares in 

which you have an interest.  Section 167(3) of Act refers.  
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Declarable Interest no. 4 

iv See note iii above. 

 

Holding (shares etc.) 

v "holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account 

with a financial institution (see declarable interest no. 5). 

 

 

Shadow Directorship 

 vi "shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow 

director for the purposes of the Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable 

interest no. 6). 

  

  

 Declarable Interest no. 7 
vii Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical 

services, it is only necessary to state that such services were supplied. 
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Justin Moylan

Date of election or co-option 2020-02-24

Appropriate Period 15/02/2023 - 16/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand its
meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise of
my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local
Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 16/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you. In
relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the date of
the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government Act
2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be required)
during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be specified.
Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf or
otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Public Representitave 
Town Hall
Marine Rd
DunLaoghaire



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a member
of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period and without
prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit or
part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

98 St. Begnets Villas,
Dalkey,
Co. Dublin.
A96DH70

Residance / Family home.

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A
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5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company or
other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if
the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other than
one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A 



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects which
the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87 at any
time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the
commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or which in
the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for
both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse, where
such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the supply
of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services
supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied under such a
contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded €6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your
previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is deemed
under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a person who
is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other company for the
purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not have
to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other
body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the lesser of
€12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the company or body
or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes of
shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Peter O'Brien

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-24

Appropriate Period 24/01/2023 - 10/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Peter O'Brien

Dated: 18/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Trade Union Offical 
SIPTU 
Liberty Hall
Dublin 1 



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

Family Home

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/A

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

IADT, Dun Laoghaire, Co. Dublin 

dlr Mill Theatre, Dundrum, Dublin 16 

Education 

Arts



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Schedule – S.I. No. 29 of 2015  

  

Part 1 Form A – Local Authority Members 

   

          Dún Laoghaire Rathdown Council 

  

  Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration  

Name Juliet O’Connell 

Date of election or co-option  
20/05/2019 

Appropriate period ◊  31/01/2023 – 31/01/2024 

  

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as 

required by section 171 of the Local Government Act 2001 and which I have 

set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for 

disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 

2001 or under section 20 of the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,  

  

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and 

further declare that I understand its meaning, and  

  

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct 

for Councillors in the exercise of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for  

Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local 

Government Act 2001).  

     

  

Signed: ___ _ Dated:____31/1//2024_________  

  

◊ Appropriate Period
  

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. 

For a first declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the 
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form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of 

your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.  
Part 2 Declarable Interests  

  

  

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of 

the Local Government Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests 

held by you (or your nominee as may be required) during the appropriate period. The 

amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be specified.  

Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.  

  

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land 

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or 

employed, whether on your own behalf or otherwise, and which relates to 

dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of profession, 
occupation etc. relating to land  

Business Address  
  

 N/A N/A 

  

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.  

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other 

occupation held by you during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of profession, 
occupation, etc.  

Business Address  
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 Company Director – Retail 
59 Upper Georges Street 
Dun Laoghaire 

  3. Land (ownership, interest)  

Any estate or interest you have in landi in the State (including the case where you 

or your nominee, is a member of a companyii or other body which has an estate 

or interest in land) during the appropriate period and without prejudice to  

  the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include  

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of 

land, whether or not a deposit or part payment has been made under the 

contract; and  

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or 

not any consideration has been paid for it, or land in respect of which such 

an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been conveyed 

to you,  

  

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relatesiii.  
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4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.  
  

Any business of dealing in or developing landiv carried on during the appropriate 

period by a company or other body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a  

  member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.  
   

N/A

 
5. Shares etc.  

Any holdingv by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like 

investments in, a particular company or other enterprise or undertaking (which 

does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if the 

aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the 

appropriate period.  

  

Name and address of Company 
where shares etc. are held  

Nature of Business of Company etc.  
  

Property Address  Purpose for which used  

N/A N/A 

  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  



     

  
Form A – Local Authority Members 

Page 1 of 8  

 Juliet O’Connell Limited 
59 Upper Georges Street 
Dun Laoghaire  Clothing Alterations 

   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 6.  Directorships  

Any directorship or shadow directorshipvi of any company held by you during the 

appropriate period other than one held by virtue of membership of or employment 

by a local authority.  

  

Business Address of Company  Nature of Business  
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59 Upper Georges Street 
Dun Laoghaire 

Retail 

 7. Gifts, Property and Services  

  

Gifts  

  

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the 

appropriate period, but excluding  
  

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or 

of your child or of a child of your spouse [spouse includes a person with 

whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;  

  

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the 

appropriate period, as respects which the value, or the aggregate value, 

of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed  

€634.87 at any time during the appropriate period;  
  

(b) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999.  
  

Property and Servicesvii  

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or 

more than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, for a 

consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the 

commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or 

prices, by more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded  

  €634.87; or  

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more 

than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, free of charge 
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if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price 
or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in  

 the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for both (a) and (b) excluding (i) property supplied 

or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of 

your spouse, where such supply or loan  

  was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,  

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999.  

  

Description of  Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier and/or  
Gift, Property 
and/or Service  

Lender  
  

 N/A N/A 

 8. Local Authority Contracts  

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or 

indirectly interested for the supply of goods or services to a local authority during 

the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services supplied during the 

period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied 

under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of 

their value exceeded €6,348.69.  
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 9.  Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.  

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, 

consultant or adviser during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of Position  
  

Name and Address of Person / Company /  
Organisation  

 N/A N/A 

  

 10.  Any Other Additional Interests  

  Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.  

       N/A 
   

 
   

NOTES  

  

Name and Address 
of Contractor  Description of Contract  Local Authority 

Concerned  

N/A N/A N/A 
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  Appropriate Period  

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of 

declarable interests. For a first declaration appropriate period means the period 

of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual declaration form is 

signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the 

date of your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.  

  

  Non Declaration of Amount(s)  

  The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified.  

 (Section 171(5)) of the Act).  

Land  

  

i “land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests 

in the State should be declared.  
   

Company  

  

ii Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the 

Companies Act, 1963 is deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or 

to be another such company’s holding company, a person who is a member of the 

first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other 

company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).  

  

Non-declaration of certain land interests  

  

iii An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in 

or developing land does not have to be declared where such interest is by 

reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other body by 

you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not 

exceed the lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100
th part of the total nominal value of either 

the issued share capital of the company or body or, where that capital is issued 

in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes 

of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.  
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  Declarable Interest no. 4 iv See note iii above.  

  

Holding (shares etc.)  

  

v "holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with 

a financial institution (see declarable interest no. 5).  
   

  

Shadow Directorship  

  

vi "shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow 

director for the purposes of the Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable 

interest no. 6).  
   

  

  Declarable Interest no. 7  

vii Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical 

services, it is only necessary to state that such services were supplied.  
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Maeve O'Connell

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-25

Appropriate Period 27/02/2023 - 26/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed:
Maeve O'Connell

Dated: 26/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

na na

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Lecturer TuDublin Aungier Street, Dublin



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

Family Home

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

NA



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

Diageo, UK Drink

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

Brigus, Dublin consultancy



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

NA NA



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

NA NA NA

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

NA NA

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

No



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Oisin O'Connor

Date of election or co-option 2020-12-14

Appropriate Period 31/01/2023 - 30/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 30/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/A N/A

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

N/A N/A



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

N/A N/A

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

Google Ireland Barrow St, Dublin 4

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

DLR Leisure
Dlr Leisure Loughlinstown, 
Loughlinstown Drive, Loughlinstown, 
Dublin

Council-owned leisure services company



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/A N/A

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Jim O'Leary

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-24

Appropriate Period 01/02/2023 - 31/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 31/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

n/a n/a

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

none n/a



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

none n/a

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

none



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

none n/a

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

none n/a



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

none n/a



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

n/a n/a n/a

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

n/a n/a

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

none



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Una Power

Date of election or co-option 2019-05-26

Appropriate Period 02/03/2023 - 29/02/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 29/02/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

n/a n/a

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

n/a n/a



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

Family Home

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

n/a



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

n/a n/a

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

n/a n/a



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

n/a
n/a



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

n/a n/a n/a

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

n/a n/a

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

n/a



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.



Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Dave Quinn

Date of election or co-option 2019-06-08

Appropriate Period 01/02/2023 - 31/01/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand
its meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise
of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the
Local Government Act 2001).

Signed: Dated: 31/01/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you.
In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the
date of the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government
Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be
required) during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not
be specified. Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf
or otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

N/a N/a

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Software engineer working on design and
delivery of payroll software products
and services

Pascal Software Ltd
20 Longford Terrace
Monkstown
Co. Dublin



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a
member of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period
and without prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit
or part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

20 Monkstown Crescent
Monkstown
Co. Dublin

Part of residential home, but it has a
separate Eircode. Currently used for
residential purposes but planning
permission granted to convert it to
café and retail purpose

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/a



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company
or other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing
land) if the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

Pascal Software Ltd
20 Longford Terrace
Monkstown
Co. Dublin 

Payroll software systems and associated
support services.

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other
than one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

Pascal Software Ltd.
20 Longford Terrace
Monkstown
Co. Dublin

Southside Partnership CLG
Old Post Office, Main Street
Blackrock
Co. Dublin

Payroll software systems and associated
support services.

SSP is an independent local development
company delivering a range of
programmes and services in Dún
Laoghaire Rathdown.



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects
which the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87
at any time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than
the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or
which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but
for both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse,
where such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/a N/a



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the
supply of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or
services supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied
under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded
€6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/a N/a N/a

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

N/a N/a

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/a



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of
your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is
deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a
person who is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other
company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not
have to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company
or other body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the
lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the
company or body or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of
the class or classes of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).

Declarable Interest no. 7



Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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Schedule – S.I. No. 29 of 2015  

  

  

Part 1 Form A – Local Authority Members  

  

  

          Dún Laoghaire Rathdown Council 

  

  Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration  

Name  Cllr Barry Saul 

Date of election or co-option  
25th May 2019 

Appropriate period ◊  2023 

  

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as 

required by section 171 of the Local Government Act 2001 and which I have 

set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for 

disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 

2001 or under section 20 of the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,  

  

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and 

further declare that I understand its meaning, and  

  

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct 

for Councillors in the exercise of my functions. (The Code of Conduct for  

Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local 

Government Act 2001).  

     

  

Signed: Barry Saul                                    Dated:29th February 2024  
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◊ Appropriate Period
  

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. 

For a first declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the 

form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of 

your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.  
Part 2 Declarable Interests  

  

  

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of 

the Local Government Act 2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests 

held by you (or your nominee as may be required) during the appropriate period. The 

amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be specified.  

Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.  

  

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land 

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or 

employed, whether on your own behalf or otherwise, and which relates to 

dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of profession, 
occupation etc. relating to land  

Business Address  
  

 Director of Dlr Properties  c/o Cherrywood Dublin 18  

  

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.  

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other 

occupation held by you during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of profession, 
occupation, etc.  

Business Address  
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 Sales Manager Sealpack ltd 
 Jamestown Industrial Centre Inchicore 

Dublin 8  

  3. Land (ownership, interest)  

Any estate or interest you have in landi in the State (including the case where you 

or your nominee, is a member of a companyii or other body which has an estate 

or interest in land) during the appropriate period and without prejudice to  

  the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include  

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of 

land, whether or not a deposit or part payment has been made under the 

contract; and  

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or 

not any consideration has been paid for it, or land in respect of which such 

an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been conveyed 

to you,  

  

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relatesiii.  
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4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.  
  

Any business of dealing in or developing landiv carried on during the appropriate 

period by a company or other body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a  

  member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.  
   
        DLR Properties C/o Cherry wood Dublin 18  

 

5. Shares etc.  

Any holdingv by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like 

investments in, a particular company or other enterprise or undertaking (which 

does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if the 

aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the 

appropriate period.  

  

Name and address of Company 
where shares etc. are held  

Nature of Business of Company etc.  
  

 n/a  n/a 

   

  

Property Address  Purpose for which used  

Dlr Properties c/o 
Cherrywood Dublin 
18  

Development land 



     

  
Form A – Local Authority Members 

Page 1 of 8  

 6.  Directorships  

Any directorship or shadow directorshipvi of any company held by you during the 

appropriate period other than one held by virtue of membership of or employment 

by a local authority.  

  

Business Address of Company  Nature of Business  

DDSL 
Dlr Properties  
MMYFC 

C/o Abbottstown Dublin 15 
C/o Cherrywood Dublin 18  
c/o 27 Ardilea Downs Mount Anville Dublin 18  

  

 7. Gifts, Property and Services  

  

Gifts  

  

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the 

appropriate period, but excluding  
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(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or 

of your child or of a child of your spouse [spouse includes a person with 

whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;  

  

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the 

appropriate period, as respects which the value, or the aggregate value, 

of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed  

€634.87 at any time during the appropriate period;  

  

(b) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999.  

  

Property and Servicesvii  

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or 

more than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, for a 

consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the 

commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or 

prices, by more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded  

  €634.87; or  

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more 

than once by the same person, during the appropriate period, free of charge 
if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price 
or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in  

 the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for both (a) and (b) excluding (i) property supplied 

or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of 

your spouse, where such supply or loan  

  was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,  

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation 

statement under the Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and 

Expenditure) Act 1999.  

  

Description of  Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier and/or  
Gift, Property 
and/or Service  

Lender  
  

 n/a  n/a 
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 8. Local Authority Contracts  

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or 

indirectly interested for the supply of goods or services to a local authority during 

the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services supplied during the 

period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied 

under such a contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of 

their value exceeded €6,348.69.  

  

  

  

 9.  Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.  

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, 

consultant or adviser during the appropriate period.  

  

Description of Position  
  

Name and Address of Person / Company /  
Organisation  

 n/a n/a 

  

 10.  Any Other Additional Interests  

  Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.  
   

n/a 
   

NOTES  

  

  Appropriate Period  

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of 

declarable interests. For a first declaration appropriate period means the period 

of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual declaration form is 

Name and Address 
of Contractor  Description of Contract  Local Authority 

Concerned  

n/a n/a n/a 
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signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the 

date of your previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.  

  

  Non Declaration of Amount(s)  

  The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified.  

 (Section 171(5)) of the Act).  

Land  

  

i “land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests 

in the State should be declared.  
   

Company  

  

ii Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the 

Companies Act, 1963 is deemed under that section to be a subsidiary of another or 

to be another such company’s holding company, a person who is a member of the 

first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other 

company for the purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).  

  

Non-declaration of certain land interests  

  

iii An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in 

or developing land does not have to be declared where such interest is by 

reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other body by 

you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not 

exceed the lesser of €12,697.38, or 1/100
th part of the total nominal value of either 

the issued share capital of the company or body or, where that capital is issued 

in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes 

of shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.  
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  Declarable Interest no. 4 iv See note iii above.  

  

Holding (shares etc.)  

  

v "holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with 

a financial institution (see declarable interest no. 5).  
   

  

Shadow Directorship  

  

vi "shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow 

director for the purposes of the Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable 

interest no. 6).  
   

  

  Declarable Interest no. 7  

vii Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical 

services, it is only necessary to state that such services were supplied.  
       
                   

 















































Schedule

Part 1

Form A – Local Authority Members

Dún Laoghaire – Rathdown County Council

Local Government Act 2001 - Part 15 - Annual Declaration

Name Lauren Tuite

Date of election or co-option 2024-01-15

Appropriate Period 03/03/2023 - 01/03/2024

1. I hereby furnish the following particulars of my declarable interests as required by section 171 of the Local
Government Act 2001 and which I have set out at paragraphs 1 to 10 of this form. None of the grounds for
disqualification referred to in section 13, or 182 of the Local Government Act 2001 or under section 20 of the
Local Elections (Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999 apply to me,

2. I hereby declare that I have read the Code of Conduct for Councillors and further declare that I understand its
meaning, and

3. I hereby undertake to have regard to and be guided by the Code of Conduct for Councillors in the exercise of
my functions. (The Code of Conduct for Councillors was issued by the Minister under section 169 of the Local
Government Act 2001).

Signed: Lauren Tuite Dated: 01/03/2024

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration this means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the form is signed by you. In
relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your previous declaration and the date of
the next declaration.



Part 2

Declarable Interests

In relation to each of the following declarable interests as specified in section 175 of the Local Government Act
2001, you should provide particulars of any such interests held by you (or your nominee as may be required)
during the appropriate period. The amount or monetary value of any declarable interests need not be specified.
Notes related to certain declarable interests are at the back of this form.

1. Profession, occupation, etc. relating to dealing in or developing land

Any profession, business or occupation in which you are engaged or employed, whether on your own behalf or
otherwise, and which relates to dealing in or developing land during the appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc.
relating to land Business Address

Owner/developer of mixed use 
commercial & residential 
property at 122 Emmet Road, 
Inchicore Dublin 8.

122 Emmet Road, Inchicore, 
Dublin 8

2. Other profession, occupation, etc.

Any other remunerated trade, profession, employment, vocation, or other occupation held by you during the
appropriate period.

Description of profession, occupation etc. Business Address

Communications Assistant to 
Minister Eamon Ryan

Department of Transport
Leeson Lane
Dublin 3



3. Land (ownership, interest)

Any estate or interest you have in land in the State (including the case where you or your nominee, is a member
of a company or other body which has an estate or interest in land) during the appropriate period and without
prejudice to the foregoing an interest in land shall be deemed to include

(a) your interest in any contract entered into by you for the purchase or sale of land, whether or not a deposit or
part payment has been made under the contract; and

(b) your interest in any option held by you to purchase or sell land, whether or not any consideration has been
paid for it, or land in respect of which such an option has been exercised by you but which has not yet been
conveyed to you,

but excluding an interest to which section 167(3) of the Act relates.

Property Address Purpose for which used

122 Emmet Road
Inchicore
Dublin 8

A mixed use 
commercial/residential 
building currently under 
development which will be 
leased to tenants as a 
commercial enterprise

4. Company business of dealing in land, etc.

Any business of dealing in or developing land carried on during the appropriate period by a company or other
body of which you, or any nominee of yours, is a member, if not declared elsewhere in this form.

N/A



5. Shares etc.

Any holding by you of shares in, or bonds or debentures of, or other like investments in, a particular company or
other enterprise or undertaking (which does not relate to land or any business of dealing in or developing land) if
the aggregate value of the holding exceeded €12,697.38 at any time during the appropriate period.

Name and address of Company where shares etc.
are held Nature of Business of Company etc.

N/A N/AA

6. Directorships

Any directorship or shadow directorship of any company held by you during the appropriate period other than
one held by virtue of membership of or employment by a local authority.

Business Address of Company Nature of Business

N/A N/A



7. Gifts, Property and Services

Gifts

(1) Any gift, including foreign travel facilities, given to you during the appropriate period, but excluding

(a) a gift given to you by a relative or friend of yours or of your spouse, or of your child or of a child of your
spouse [spouse includes a person with whom you are co-habiting] for purely personal reasons only;

(b) a gift given to you, or gifts given to you by the same person, during the appropriate period, as respects which
the value, or the aggregate value, of the property the subject of the gift or gifts did not exceed €634.87 at any
time during the appropriate period;

(c) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Property and Services

(2) (a) Any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same
person,during the appropriate period, for a consideration or considerations, or at a price or prices less than the
commercial consideration or considerations, or the commercial price or prices, by more than €634.87 or which in
the aggregate exceeded €634.87; or

(b) any property supplied or lent, or a service supplied to you, once or more than once by the same person,
during the appropriate period, free of charge if the commercial consideration or considerations, or the
commercial price or prices was, or were more than €634.87 or which in the aggregate exceeded €634.87; but for
both (a) and (b) excluding

(i) property supplied or lent or a service supplied to you by a relative or friend of yours, or of your spouse, where
such supply or loan was in the nature of a gift to you and for personal reasons only,

(ii) a donation which you have already declared in a current donation statement under the Local Elections
(Disclosure of Donations and Expenditure) Act 1999.

Description of Gift, Property and/or Service Name and Address of Benefactor, Supplier
and/or Lender

N/A N/A 



8. Local Authority Contracts

Any contract to which you were a party, or were in any other way, directly or indirectly interested for the supply
of goods or services to a local authority during the appropriate period, if the value of the goods or services
supplied during the period exceeded €6,348.69 or, in case other goods or services were supplied under such a
contract to a local authority during that period, if the aggregate of their value exceeded €6,348.69.

Name and Address of
Contractor Description of Contract Local Authority Concerned

N/A N/A N/A

9. Political or public affairs/lobbyist etc.

Any remunerated position held by you as a political or public affairs lobbyist, consultant or adviser during the
appropriate period.

Description of Position Name and Address of Person / Company /
Organisation

Communications Assistant for 
Eamon Ryan, Green Party

Department of Transport 
Leeson Lane
Dublin 2

10. Any Other Additional Interests

Any other interest which you may wish to volunteer.

N/A



NOTES

Appropriate Period

Appropriate period means the period to be covered when giving particulars of declarable interests. For a first
declaration appropriate period means the period of 12 months leading up to and including the day the annual
declaration form is signed by you. In relation to subsequent declarations it is the period between the date of your
previous declaration and the date of the next declaration.

Non Declaration of Amount(s)

The amount or monetary value of any declarable interest need not be specified. (Section 171(5)) of the Act).

Land

“land” includes all property including buildings, dwellings, etc.. All land interests in the State should be
declared.

Company

Where any body which is a company within the meaning of section 155 of the Companies Act, 1963 is deemed
under that section to be a subsidiary of another or to be another such company’s holding company, a person who
is a member of the first-mentioned such company is deemed also to be a member of the other company for the
purposes of annual declaration. (Section 166(3) of the Act).

Non-declaration of certain land interests

An interest in land or an interest relating to land or any business of dealing in or developing land does not have
to be declared where such interest is by reason only of the beneficial ownership of shares in a company or other
body by you or by your nominee and the total nominal value of those shares does not exceed the lesser of
€12,697.38, or 1/100th part of the total nominal value of either the issued share capital of the company or body
or, where that capital is issued in shares of more than one class, the issued share capital of the class or classes of
shares in which you have an interest. Section 167(3) of Act refers.

Declarable Interest no. 4

See note iii above.

Holding (shares etc.)

"holding" does not include money in a current, deposit or other similar account with a financial institution (see
declarable interest no. 5).

Shadow Directorship

>

"shadow directorship" means the position held by a person who is a shadow director for the purposes of the
Companies Acts, 1963 to 1999. (see declarable interest no. 6).



Declarable Interest no. 7

Insofar as services at (2) of declarable interest no. 7 relate to legal or medical services, it is only necessary to
state that such services were supplied.
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